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PDP Stage 2 Notification Map 15 - Kingston Rural, Lake Wakatipu & Gibbston (Inset)
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All Stage 1 and Stage 2 land is 
subject to the District Wide 
Earthworks Chapter 25, 
Transport Chapter 29 and
Signs Chapter 31.
 
The District Wide Annotations 
notified in Stage 1 remain 
applicable to all Stage 1 and 
Stage 2 land. Refer to the 
Proposed District PlanMaps
for the location of  the District 
Wide annotations. Specifically
the Open Space and Recrea-
tion Zoned land that was not
notified in Stage 1 is subject 
to the District Wide anno-
tations and submissions can 
be made on a District Wide 
annotation that affects this
land.
 
The Council has identified 
where the proposed Visitor 
Accommodation Sub Zones 
are to be located. Any person
may make a submission on 
the location and extent of Vi-
sitor Accommodation Sub 
Zones as it relates to Stage 1 
and Stage 2 land.


